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The Middle East Explodes as the Place to be in Project
Delivery
This year, the Middle East emerged as a global hub for project delivery. With ambitious infrastructure
projects and economic diversification initiatives, the region attracted significant investment and talent.
This surge in activity has led to increased demand for skilled project managers, particularly in sectors like
construction, energy, and technology.

Move Over Tech-Bros, As Female Project Leaders Step Up to the Plate 

2024 witnessed a notable rise in female leadership within the project management industry. Women are
breaking stereotypes and taking on prominent roles, driving innovation and fostering diverse and inclusive
work environments. This trend is not only empowering women but also enhancing the overall performance
of project teams.

Project Management Leads The Charge in Creating a Fairer and More Equitable Society 

Project management has become a powerful tool for social change. This year, we saw numerous examples
of projects aimed at addressing social and environmental challenges. From sustainable infrastructure
initiatives to community development programs, project managers are playing a crucial role in creating a
more equitable and sustainable future.

SDG is the Industry’s ‘Term of the Year’ 
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The Sustainable Development Goals (SDGs) have gained significant traction in the project management
industry. Organizations are increasingly integrating SDG principles into their projects, considering factors
like environmental impact, social responsibility, and ethical considerations. This shift towards sustainable
project delivery is driving innovation and long-term value creation.

Project Management Takes to the Global Stage 

Global collaboration and knowledge sharing have reached new heights in the project management
industry. International conferences, webinars, and online forums have provided platforms for professionals
to connect, learn, and exchange best practices. This increased global connectivity has accelerated the
evolution of project management methodologies and tools.

Global PM Salaries – The Golden Sectors Guaranteeing A Gilded Pay Check 

The demand for skilled project managers continues to drive salary growth across various industries. In
particular, sectors like technology, finance, and healthcare have experienced significant salary increases
for project professionals. This trend is expected to continue as organizations recognize the value that
skilled project managers bring to the table.

The Bombshell Industry Reports – Tearing up the Project Management Playbook

A series of groundbreaking industry reports have challenged traditional project management approaches.
These reports have highlighted the need for greater agility, adaptability, and risk management in today’s
complex and dynamic business environment. As a result, organizations are rethinking their project
management strategies and embracing innovative methodologies to deliver successful projects.
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